
15-1 

Title 15 

BUILDINGS AND CONSTRUCTION 

Chapters: 

15.04 International Building Code 
15.04.010 International Building Code Adoption. 
15.04.020 International Building Code Amendments and Deletions. 

15.08 International Residential Code 
15.08.010 International Residential Code Adoption. 
15.08.020 International Residential Code Amendments and Deletions. 

15.12 International Existing Building Code 
15.12.010 International Existing Building Code Adoption. 
15.12.020 International Existing Building Code Amendments. 

15.20 International Fire Code 
15.20.010 Adoption of the International Fire Code. 
15.20.020 Establishment and Duties of Bureau of Fire Prevention. 
15.20.030 Definitions. 
15.20.040 Amendments to the International Fire Code. 

15.30 Uniform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous Buildings 
15.40.010 Uniform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous Buildings Adoption. 

15.40 National Electrical Code 
15.40.010 National Electrical Code Adoption. 

15.50 International Code Council Electrical Code 
15.50.010 International Code Council Electrical Code, Administrative Provisions, Adoption. 
15.50.020 International Code Council Electrical Code, Administrative Provisions, Amendments. 

15.60 International Mechanical Code 
15.60.010 International Mechanical Code Adoption. 
15.60.020 International Mechanical Code Amendments. 

15.70 International Plumbing Code 
15.70.010 International Plumbing Code Adoption. 
15.70.020 International Plumbing Code Amendments and Deletions. 

15.74 International Fuel Gas Code 
15.74.010 International Fuel Gas Code Adoption. 
15.74.020 International Fuel Gas Code Amendments and Deletions. 

15.76 International Energy Conservation Code 
15.76.010 International Energy Conservation Code Adoption. 
15.76.020 International Energy Conservation Code Amendments and Deletions. 

15.80 Uniform Solar Energy Code 
15.80.010 Adoption of the Uniform Solar Energy Code, 1994 Edition. 
15.80.020 Penalty. 

15.90 Uniform Swimming Pool, Spa and Hot Tub Code 
15.90.010 Adoption of the Uniform Swimming Pool, Spa and Hot Tub Code, 1994 Edition. 
15.90.020 Penalty. 

15.94 Fee Schedule 
15.94.010 Adoption of Fee Schedule. 



15-2 

Chapter 15.04 

International Building Code 

15.04.010 International Building Code Adoption. 
15.04.020 International Building Code Amendments and Deletions. 

15.04.010 International Building Code Adoption. 

There is hereby adopted by the Town of Hayden, for the purpose of providing minimum standards 
to safeguard life or limb, health, property and public welfare by regulating and controlling the design, 
construction, quality of materials, use and occupancy, location and maintenance of all buildings and 
structures within the Town, that certain code known as the International Building Code, 2009 Edition, 
including Appendix Chapters C and J, published by the International Code Council, 4951 West 
Flossmoor Road, Country Club Hills, IL  60478.  The code, and the whole thereof, is adopted by 
reference thereto the same as if set forth in length in this section.  This adoption is subject to the 
amendments set forth herein.  (Ord. 639 § 1, 2011; Ord. 597 § 1, 2008; Ord. 582 § 1 (part), 2007; 
Ord. 660 § 1, 2014) 

15.04.020 International Building Code Amendments and Deletions. 

The International Building Code, 2009 Edition, is amended as follows:  The following sections 
and paragraphs or subparagraphs of the 2009 International Building Code are hereby amended or 
deleted as follows: 

A. The International Building Code is amended by replacing all references to "International Fire 
Code" with "adopted fire code." 

B. The International Building Code is amended by replacing all references to "ICC Electrical 
Code" with "National Electrical Code" as adopted by the State of Colorado. 

C. Section 103.1, General, is amended to read as follows: 

The Building Department is hereby created and the official in charge shall be known as the 
Building Official. 

D. Section 105.2, Work exempt from permit, is amended as follows: 

14.  Doors and window replacement is not required a permit if no structural modifications are 
required for said replacement. 

E. Section 107.5, Retention of construction documents, is amended to read as follows: 

One set of approved plans, specifications and computations shall be retained by the Town for a 
period of not less than 90 days from the date of completion of the work covered therein; and one 
set of approved plans and specifications shall be returned to the applicant, and said set shall be 
kept on the site of the building or work at all times during which the work authorized thereby is in 
progress. 



15-3 

F. Section 109.2, Schedule of fees, is amended by adding a second paragraph to read as follows: 

The fee for each permit shall be as set forth in the latest adopted fee schedule as adopted by the 
Town of Hayden. 

G. Section 116.1, Unsafe structures and equipment, is amended by adding a second paragraph, 
to read as follows: 

The Building Official may use the Uniform Code for Abatement of Dangerous Buildings, as 
adopted, to provide a just, equitable and practicable method to be cumulative with and in addition 
to any other remedy provided by this code. 

H. Section 901.1, Scope, is amended to add a second paragraph as follows: 

The authority having jurisdiction for fire protection systems shall have the authority to adopt 
additional standards for fire protection systems subject to applicable state statutes and the terms 
and conditions of any intergovernmental agreement between the Town of Hayden and any fire 
protection district. 

I. Section 903.2.8, Group R, is amended to add the following Exception: 

EXCEPTION:  An automatic sprinkler system is not required in multi-use buildings, two stories 
or less with no more than two (2) dwelling units, provided the building is constructed as required 
by Section 508.4, and an automatic and manual fire alarm system is installed in accordance with 
NFPA 72.  Sprinkler systems required by other sections and other codes must still be provided. 

J. Section 907.2.1, Group A, Exception, delete. 

K. Section 907.2.2, Group B, Exception, delete. 

L. Section 907.2.4, Group F, Exception, delete. 

M. Section 907.2.7, Group M, Exception 2, delete. 

N. Section 907.2.8.1, Manual fire alarm system, Exception 2, delete. 

O. Section 907.2.9, Group R-2, Exception 2, delete. 

P. Section 1104.4, Multilevel buildings and facilities, Exception 1, the following paragraph is 
added to this Exception: 

This exception, exempting elevator or ramp service, does not obviate or limit the obligation to 
comply with all other accessibility requirements required by this chapter.  For example, floors 
above or below the accessible ground floor must meet the requirements of this chapter except for 
elevator or ramp service.  If toilet or bathing facilities are provided on a level not served by an 
elevator or ramp, then toilet or bathing facilities must be provided on the accessible ground floor. 

Q. Section 1207.2, Air-borne sound.  The first sentence of this section is amended to read as 
follows: 



15-4 

Walls, partitions and floor/ceiling assemblies separating dwelling units from each other or from 
public or service areas shall have a sound transmission class (STC) of not less than 49 (45 if field 
tested) for air-borne noise when tested in accordance with ASTM E 90. 

R. Section 1207.3, Structure-borne sound, delete. 

S. Section 3009, CERTIFICATES OF INSPECTION, is added to read as follows: 

3009.1 General.  Elevators, dumbwaiters and escalators shall be maintained to sustain safely 
all imposed loads, to operate properly, and to be free from physical and fire hazards.  The most 
current certificate of inspection shall be on display at all times within the elevator or attached to 
escalator or dumbwaiter; or the certificate shall be available for public inspection in the office of 
the building operator. 

3009.2 Elevators.  In buildings equipped with passenger elevators, at least one elevator shall 
be maintained in operation at all times when the building is occupied. 

EXCEPTION:  Buildings equipped with only one elevator shall be permitted to have the 
elevator temporarily out of service for testing or servicing. 

T. Appendix Section J103.3, Grading fees, is added to read as follows: 

When plans or other data are required to be submitted, a plan review fee shall be paid at the 
time of submitting plans and specifications for review.  A grading permit fee shall be paid at 
permit issuance.  Said plan review and grading permit fees shall be as set forth in the latest 
adopted fee schedule as adopted by the Town of Hayden. 

(Ord. 639 § 1, 2011; Ord. 597 § 1, 2008; Ord. 582 § 1 (part), 2007; Ord. 660 § 1, 2014) 

Chapter 15.08 

International Residential Code 

15.08.010 International Residential Code Adoption. 
15.08.020 International Residential Code Amendments and Deletions. 

15.08.010 International Residential Code Adoption. 

There is hereby adopted by the Town of Hayden, for the purpose of providing minimum standards 
to safeguard life or limb, health, property and public welfare by regulating and controlling the design, 
construction, quality of materials, use and occupancy, location and maintenance of one and two-
family dwellings within the Town, that certain code known as the International Residential Code, 
2009 Edition, including Appendix Chapters E and G, published by the International Code Council, 
4951 West Flossmoor Road, Country Club Hills, IL  60478.  The code, and the whole thereof, is 
adopted by reference thereto the same as if set forth in length in this section.  This adoption is subject 
to the amendments set forth herein.  (Ord. 639 § 1, 2011; Ord. 597 § 1, 2008; Ord. 582 § 1 (part), 
2007; Ord. 660 § 1, 2014) 



15-5 

15.08.020 International Residential Code Amendments and Deletions. 

The International Residential Code, 2009 edition, is amended as follows:  The following sections 
and paragraphs or subparagraphs of the 2009 International Residential Code are hereby amended or 
deleted as follows: 

A. The International Residential Code is amended by replacing all references to "International 
Fire Code" with "adopted fire code." 

B. The International Residential Code is amended by replacing all references to "ICC Electrical 
Code" with "National Electrical Code" as adopted by the State of Colorado. 

C. The International Residential Code is amended by replacing all references to "Chapter 11 
Energy Code" with "2009 International Energy Conservation Code Chapter 4." 

D. Section R103.1, General, is amended to read as follows: 

The Building Department is hereby created and the official in charge shall be known as the 
Building Official. 

E. Section R105.2, Work exempt from permit, is amended to read as follows: 

11. Doors and window replacements in existing dwellings if no structural modifications are 
required. 

12. Roof recovering (Re-Roof) replacements if no structural modifications are required. 

13. New siding, stucco and re-siding of existing exterior walls. 

F. Section R106.5 Retention of construction documents, is amended to read as follows: 

One set of approved plans, specifications and computations shall be retained by the Town for a 
period of not less than 90 days from the date of completion of the work covered therein; and one 
set of approved plans and specifications shall be returned to the applicant, and said set shall be 
kept on the site of the building or work at all times during which the work authorized thereby is in 
progress. 

G. Section R108.2, Schedule of fees, is amended by adding a second paragraph, to read as 
follows: 

The fee for each permit shall be as set forth in the latest adopted fee schedule as adopted by the 
Town of Hayden. 

——————————————————————————— 

H. Table R301.2(1), CLIMATIC AND GEOGRAPHIC DESIGN CRITERIA, is completed 
as follows: 



15-6 

Ground 
Snow 
Load 

Wind 
Speed 
(3 sec. 
gust) 

Seismic 
Design 

Category 

Subject to Damage From 

Winter 
Design 
Temp. 

Ice Shield 
Underlayment 

Required 
Flood 

Hazard 

Air 
Freezing 

Index 

Mean 
Annual 
Temp. Weathering 

Frost 
Line 

Depth Termite Decay 

90 90 B Severe 48 in. Slight None 
to 

Slight 

-15°F Yes FIRM 
2005 

2239 40°F 

 
Minimum ground snow load equals 90 psf.  Minimum roof slow load shall equal 60 psf, snow loads for unheated structures 
and uncovered decks shall equal 75 psf. 
NOTE:  Dates of the currently effective FIRM. 

——————————————————————————— 

I. Section R302.2, Townhouses, Exception, delete. 

J. Section R305.1.1, Basements, delete. 

K. Section R311.7.9.3, Ship's ladder stairway, is added to read as follows: 

An interior fire escape stairway may serve as an exit from an area not to exceed 200 square 
feet.  The pitch of the stairway shall not exceed 60 degrees with a minimum width of 24 inches.  
Treads shall be not less than 4 inches in width and the rise between treads shall not exceed 10 
inches.  An approved handrail shall be provided on each side. 

K. Section R311.7.9.4, Alternating tread stairway, is added to read as follows: 

Alternating tread stairways may serve as an exit from an area not to exceed 200 square feet.  
Alternating tread stairways shall have a minimum projected tread of 8.5 inches (216 mm) with a 
minimum tread depth of 10.5 inches (267 mm).  The rise to the next alternating tread surface 
should not be more than 8 inches (203 mm).  The initial tread of the stairway shall begin at the 
same elevation as the platform, landing or floor surface.  An approved handrail shall be provided 
on each side. 

M. Section R313, Automatic fire sprinkler systems, delete entire section. 

N. Section R403.1.4.1, Frost protection, Exception 1, is amended to read as follows: 

1. Freestanding accessory structures (private garages) with an area of 576 square feet (53.5 
m2) or less and an eave height of 10 feet (3048 mm) or less shall not be required to be protected. 

O. Chapter 11, Energy Efficiency.  Delete this chapter in its entirety and replace with: 

All buildings governed by the IRC shall comply with the 2009 Energy Conservation Code 
Chapter 4. 

P. Section R1004.4, Unvented gas log heaters, delete. 

Q. Section G2406.2 (303.3) Prohibited locations, Exception 3, delete. 



15-7 

R. Section G2406.2 (303.3) Prohibited locations, Exception 4, delete. 

S. Section G2406.4, LP-gas appliance in pit or basement, is added to read as follows: 

Liquefied petroleum gas piping may serve a gas appliance located in a pit, basement or similar 
location when the following conditions are met: 

1. There shall be installed a listed gas detector that is interlocked to a listed solenoid valve 
located so as to shut off the supply of gas to the building in the event of an alarm. 

2. There shall be installed an exhaust system for the purpose of removing unburned gases.  
The exhaust system shall be interlocked to the gas detector so as to operate automatically in the 
event of an alarm.  The exhaust system shall provide a minimum of four (4) air changes per 
hour, and the exhaust intake shall be located within 6 inches of the floor. 

T. Section G2415.10, Minimum burial depth, is amended by the addition of the following: 

All plastic fuel gas piping shall be installed a minimum of 18 inches (457 mm) below grade. 

U. Section G2433 (603), Log lighters, delete. 

V. Section G2445.2 (621.2) Prohibited use, is amended to read as follows: 

Unvented room heaters are not to be installed in dwelling units. 

W. Section G2445.7.1 (621.7.1), Unvented decorative room heaters, delete. 

X. Section P2717.2, Sick dishwasher, is amended as follows: 

A sink and dishwasher are permitted to discharge through a single 1.5 inch (38 mm) trap after 
the dishwasher passes through an air gap device.  No domestic dishwashing machine shall be 
directly connected to a drainage system or food waste disposer without the use of an approved 
dishwasher air gap fitting on the discharge side of the dishwashing machine.  Listed air gap 
fittings shall be installed with the flood level (FL) marking at or above the flood level of the sink 
or drainboard, whichever is higher, or separately trapped with air gap located on the stand pipe. 

Y. Section P2717.3, Sink dishwasher and food grinder, is amended as follows: 

The combined discharge from a sink, dishwasher, dishwasher and food waste grinder is 
permitted to discharge through a single 1.5 inch (38 mm) trap after the dishwasher passes through 
an air gap device.  No domestic dishwashing machine shall be directly connected to a drainage 
system or food waste disposer without the use of an approved dishwasher air gap fitting on the 
discharge side of the dishwashing machine.  Listed air gap fittings shall be installed with the flood 
level (FL) marking at or above the flood level of the sink or drainboard, whichever is higher, or 
separately trapped with air gap located on the stand pipe. 

Z. Section P3103.1, Roof extension, is amended by filling in both areas where indicated to read 
"12 inches (4572 mm)." 



15-8 

AA.  Section E3301.1, Applicability, is amended by the addition of a second paragraph as 
follows: 

Any conflict with the provisions of this code and the current electrical code adopted by the 
State of Colorado Electrical Board shall comply with the current State code. 

(Ord. 639 § 1, 2011; Ord. 597 § 1, 2008; Ord. 582 § 1 (part), 2007; Ord. 660 § 1, 2014) 

Chapter 15.12 

International Existing Building Code 

15.12.010 International Existing Building Code Adoption. 
15.12.020 International Existing Building Code Amendments. 

15.12.010 International Existing Building Code Adoption. 

There is hereby adopted by the Town of Hayden, for the purpose of providing minimum life safety 
requirements for all existing buildings within the Town that undergo alteration or a change in use, that 
certain code known as the International Existing Building Code, 2009 Edition, published by the 
International Code Council, 4951 West Flossmoor Road, Country Club Hills, IL  60478.  The code, 
and the whole thereof, is adopted by reference thereto the same as if set forth in length in this section.  
This adoption is subject to the amendments set forth herein.  (Ord. 639 § 1, 2011; Ord. 587 § 1, 2008; 
Ord. 582 § 1 (part), 2007; Ord. 660 § 1, 2014) 

15.12.020 International Existing Building Code Amendments. 

The International Existing Building Code, 2009 Edition, is amended as follows:  The following 
sections and paragraphs or subparagraphs of the 2009 International Existing Building Code are 
hereby amended or deleted as follows: 

A. Section 103.1, General, is amended to read as follows: 

The Building Department is hereby created and the official in charge shall be known as the 
Building Official.  Building Official shall be synonymous with code official in all other references 
in this code. 

(Ord. 639 § 1, 2011; Ord. 597 § 1, 2008; Ord. 582 § 1 (part), 2007; Ord. 660 § 1, 2014) 

Chapter 15.20 

International Fire Code * 

15.20.010 Adoption of the International Fire Code. 
15.20.020 Establishment and Duties of Bureau of Fire Prevention. 
                                                      
* Prior ordinance history:  Ord. 524. 



15-9 

15.20.030 Definitions. 
15.20.040 Amendments to the International Fire Code. 

15.20.010 Adoption of the International Fire Code. 

There is hereby adopted by the Town of Hayden for the purpose of prescribing regulations 
governing conditions hazardous to life and property from fire, hazardous materials or explosion, that 
certain Code known as the International Fire Code, including Appendix Chapters B and C, published 
by the International Code Council, being in particular the 2006 edition thereof and the whole thereof, 
save and except such portions as are hereinafter deleted, modified or amended by Section 15.20.020 
below, one (1) copy of which has been and is now filed in the Town Hall and the same are hereby 
adopted and incorporated as fully as if set out at length herein, and from the date on which this 
ordinance shall take effect, the provision thereof shall be controlling within the limits of the Town of 
Hayden within the West Routt Fire Protection District.  (Ord. 634 § 1, 2010; Ord. 585 § 1, 2007) 

15.20.020 Establishment and Duties of Bureau of Fire Prevention. 

A. The International Fire Code as adopted and amended herein shall be enforced by the Fire 
Chief.  The Fire Chief, or his or her designee, shall be in charge of the Bureau of Fire Prevention. 

B. Enforcement of the International Fire Code, including but not limited to permits and 
inspections shall be done pursuant to the fire codes and regulations adopted by the West Routt Fire 
Protection District.  (Ord. 634 § 2, 2010; Ord. 585 § 2, 2007) 

15.20.030 Definitions. 

Wherever the word "jurisdiction" is used in the International Fire Code, it is West Routt Fire 
Protection District.  (Ord. 634 § 3, 2010; Ord. 585 § 3, 2007) 

15.20.040 Amendments to the International Fire Code. 

The 2006 Edition of the International Fire Code is subject to the following amendments and 
deletions: 

A. Section 105, Permits, shall be amended to add the following sections: 

105.1.4 Permit Fees.  The fee for each permit shall be as set forth in the fee schedule adopted 
by the jurisdiction.  All other permits fees shall be as listed in Table 105-A. 

Whenever work for which a permit is required by the fire code has been commenced without first 
obtaining a permit, a special investigation shall be made before a permit may be issued for such 
work.  An investigation fee, in addition to the permit fee, may be collected whether or not a permit 
is then or subsequently issued.  The investigation fee shall be equal to the amount of the permit fee 
required by Table 105-A. 

105.1.5 Plan Review Fees.  The fee for each plan review shall be set forth in the fee schedule 
adopted by the jurisdiction. 



15-10 

TABLE 105-A 
 

Section I 
Plan Review Fee Schedule 

Fees 

Single-family $35.00 

Multi-family $50.00 

Commercial $50.00 

Radio amplification plan review $50.00 

Development review $50.00 

Section II 
Fees for Special Activity Permits 

Fees 

Carnivals and fairs $50.00 per event/location 

Dry hydrant permit $250.00 per hydrant 

Explosive or blasting permit $50.00 per event/location/inspection 

Fireworks permit Retail display – $50.00 per display 

Public aerial display – $100.00 per event 

Underground storage tank removal $50.00 for the first tank and $20.00 for every additional tank 
removed at the same location 

Open burn permit $25.00 every 6 months/per location 

Open flame permit/flame effect $25.00 per event 

Tents, canopies and temporary membrane 
structures 

$25.00 – 200—1,000 sq. ft. 

$50.00 – 1,001—2,500 sq. ft. 

$200.00 – > 2,501 sq. ft. 

Miscellaneous permits $25.00 minimum/$50.00 maximum 

Section III 
Other Inspections and Fees 

1.  Special request, reinspections or inspections outside of normal business hours  
(minimum charge – 2 hours) ................................................................................................ $50.00 per hour * 

2.  Reinspection fees assessed at........................................................................................... $50.00 per hour * 

3.  Inspections for which no fee is specifically indicated (minimum charge – ½ hour) ........ $50.00 per hour * 

4.  Additional plan review required by changes, additions or revisions to plans or not  
otherwise noted (minimum charge – ½ hour) ....................................................................... $50.00 per hour * 

5.  Test of water tanks with a Type 1 Engine (minimum charge – 1 hour) ......................... $218.00 per hour * 

6.  For use of outside consultants for plan checking and inspections, or both ........................... actual costs ** 

 
* Or the total hourly cost to the jurisdiction, whichever is greatest.  This cost shall include supervision, overhead, 

equipment, hourly wages and fringe benefits of the employees involved. 
** Actual costs include administrative and overhead costs. 



15-11 

B. Section 105.6.30, Open burning, is amended to delete the Exception. 

C. Section 307.2, Permit required, is amended to read as follows: 

A permit shall be obtained from the fire code official in accordance with Section 105.6 prior to 
kindling a fire. 

D. Section 501.1, Scope, is amended to add a second paragraph as follows: 

The fire code official shall have the authority to adopt additional standards for fire service 
features subject to applicable provisions of State statutes and home rule charter. 

E. Section 901.1, Scope, is amended to add a second paragraph as follows: 

The fire code official shall have the authority to adopt additional standards for fire protection 
systems subject to applicable provisions of state statutes and home rule charter. 

F. Section 903.2.7, Group R, is amended to add the following Exception: 

EXCEPTION:  An automatic sprinkler system is not required in multi-use buildings, two stories 
or less with no more than 2 dwelling units, provided the building is constructed as required by 
Section 302.3.2, and an automatic and manual fire alarm system is installed in accordance with 
NFPA 72.  Sprinkler systems required by other sections and other codes must still be provided. 

G. Section 907.2.1, Group A, Exception, delete. 

H. Section 907.2.2, Group B, Exception, delete. 

I. Section 907.2.4, Group F, Exception, delete. 

J. Section 907.2.7, Group M, Exception, delete. 

K. Section 907.2.8.1, Manual fire alarm system, Exception 2, delete. 

L. Section 907.2.9, Group R-2, Exception 2, delete. 

M. Section 907.3.1, Location, Exception, delete. 

N. Section 1007.3, Exit stairways, Exceptions to read as follows: 

The area of refuge is not required at unenclosed interior exit stairways as permitted by Section 
1020.1 in buildings or facilities that are equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system 
installed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 or 903.3.1.2. 

The clear width of 48 inches (1219 mm) between the handrails is not required at exit stairways in 
buildings or facilities equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system installed in 
accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 or 903.3.1.2. 



15-12 

Areas of refuge are not required at exit stairways in buildings or facilities equipped throughout 
with an automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 or 903.3.1.2. 

The clear width of 48 inches (1219 mm) between the handrails is not required for exit stairways 
accessed from a horizontal exit. 

Areas of refuge are not required at exit stairways serving open parking garages. 

Areas of refuge are not required for smoke protected seating areas complying with Section 
1025.6.2 

Areas of refuge are not required in Group R-2 occupancies. 

O. Section 1009.1, Stairway width, the first paragraph is amended to read as follows: 

The width of stairways shall be determined as specified in Section 1005.1, but such width shall 
be not less than 48 inches (1219 mm).  See Section 1007.3 for accessible means of egress 
stairways. 

P. Section 1009.1, Stairway width, Exception 1, is amended to read as follows: 

1. Stairways serving one individual dwelling unit in Group R, Division 1 or 2, or serving 
Group U Occupancies may be 36 inches (914 mm) in width. 

Q. Section 1012.3, Handrail graspability, is amended to read as follows: 

Handrails with a circular cross section shall have an outside diameter of at least 1.25 inches (32 
mm) and not greater than 2 inches (51 mm) or shall provide equivalent graspability.  If a handrail 
is not circular, it shall have a maximum horizontal cross section dimension of at least 1.25 inches 
(32 mm) and not greater than 3 inches (57 mm).  The narrowest horizontal cross section of the 
handgrip portion of the handrail shall have a minimum dimension .75 inch less than the maximum 
horizontal cross section.  The surface of the handgrip portion of the handrail shall have a perimeter 
dimension of at least 4 inches (102 mm) and not greater than 6.25 inches (160 mm) measured to 
the centerline of the narrowest horizontal cross section.  Edges shall have a minimum radius of 
0.01 inch (0.25 mm). 

R. Section 1028.2, Reliability, is amended to add a second paragraph as follows: 

All exits to a public way shall be designed to be a minimum of 4 feet wide and of an all-
weather surface capable of being maintained unobstructed year round. 

(Ord. 634 § 4, 2010; Ord. 585 § 4, 2007) 

Chapter 15.30 

Uniform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous Buildings 

15.30.010 Uniform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous Buildings Adoption. 



15-13 

15.30.010 Uniform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous Buildings Adoption. 

There is hereby adopted by the Town, for the purposes of providing a just, equitable and practical 
method, to be cumulative with and in addition to any other remedy available by law whereby 
buildings or structures in the Town which from any cause endanger the life, limb, health, property, 
safety or welfare of the general public or their occupants may be required to be repaired, vacated or 
demolished, that certain code known as the Uniform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous Buildings, 
1997 Edition, published by the International Code Council, 500 New Jersey Avenue, NW, 6th Floor, 
Washington DC  20001.  The code, and the whole thereof, is adopted by reference thereto the same as 
if set forth in length in this section.  (Ord. 660 § 1, 2014) 

Chapter 15.40 

National Electrical Code 

15.40.010 National Electrical Code Adoption. 

15.40.010 National Electrical Code Adoption. 

There is hereby adopted by the Town of Hayden, for the purpose of regulating the installation and 
use of electric conductors and equipment within the Town, that certain code known as the National 
Electric Code, published by the National Fire Protection Association, Batterymarch Park, Quincy, 
Massachusetts 02269.  The code, edition, as currently adopted by the State of Colorado, State 
Electrical Board.  (Ord. 639 § 1, 2011; Ord. 597 § 1, 2008; Ord. 582 § 1 (part), 2007; Ord. 660 § 1, 
2014) 

Chapter 15.50 

International Code Council Electrical Code 

15.50.010 International Code Council Electrical Code, Administrative Provisions, Adoption. 
15.50.020 International Code Council Electrical Code, Administrative Provisions, Amendments. 

15.50.010 International Code Council Electrical Code, Administrative Provisions, Adoption. 

There is hereby adopted by the Town of Hayden, for the purpose of providing minimum standards 
to safeguard life or limb, health, property and public welfare by regulating and controlling the design, 
construction, installation, quality of materials, location, operation, and maintenance or use of 
electrical systems and equipment within the Town, that certain code known as the International Code 
Council Electrical Code, Administrative Provisions, 2003 Edition, published by the International 
Code Council, 5203 Leesburg Pike, Suite 600, Falls Church, VA 22041-3405.  The Code, and the 
whole thereof, is adopted by reference thereto the same as if set forth in length in this section.  This 
adoption is subject to the amendments set forth herein.  (Ord. 639 § 1, 2011; Ord. 597 § 1, 2008; Ord. 
582 § 1 (part), 2007) 



15-14 

15.50.020 International Code Council Electrical Code, Administrative Provisions, 
Amendments. 

The International Code Council Electrical Code, Administrative Provisions, 2003 Edition, is 
amended as follows: 

A. Section 301.1, Creation of enforcement agency, is amended to read as follows: 

The Building Department is hereby created and the official in charge shall be known as the 
Building Official.  The Building Official shall appoint an electrical inspector to assist the building 
department in the administration and enforcement of this code.  Building Official shall be 
synonymous with code official in all other references in this code. 

B. Section 404.2.2, Schedule of permit fees, is amended by adding a second paragraph, to read 
as follows: 

The fee for each permit shall be as set forth in the latest adopted fee schedule as adopted by the 
Town of Hayden. 

C. Section 1201.1.1, Adoption, is amended to read as follows: 

Electrical systems and equipment shall be designed and constructed in accordance with the 
most current electrical code adopted by the State of Colorado Electrical Board. 

(Ord. 639 § 1, 2011; Ord. 597 § 1, 2008; Ord. 582 § 1 (part), 2007) 

Chapter 15.60 

International Mechanical Code 

15.60.010 International Mechanical Code Adoption. 
15.60.020 International Mechanical Code Amendments. 

15.60.010 International Mechanical Code Adoption. 

There is hereby adopted by the Town of Hayden, for the purpose of regulating and controlling the 
design, construction, installation, quality of materials, erection, installation, alteration, repair, 
location, relocation, replacement, addition to, use or maintenance of heating, ventilating, cooling, 
refrigeration systems, incinerators and other miscellaneous heat-producing appliances in the Town, 
that certain code known as the International Mechanical Code, 2009 Edition; published by the 
International Code Council, 4951 West Flossmoor Road, Country Club Hills, IL  60478.  The code, 
and the whole thereof, is adopted by reference thereto the same as if set forth in length in this section.  
This adoption is subject to the amendments set forth herein.  (Ord. 639 § 1, 2011; Ord. 597 § 1, 2008; 
Ord. 582 § 1 (part), 2007; Ord. 660 § 1, 2014) 



15-15 

15.60.020 International Mechanical Code Amendments. 

The International Mechanical Code, 2006 Edition, is amended as follows:  The following sections 
and paragraphs or subparagraphs of the 2009 International Mechanical Code are hereby amended or 
deleted as follows: 

A. Section 103.1, General, is amended to read as follows: 

The Building Department is hereby created and the official in charge shall be known as the 
Building Official.  Building Official shall be synonymous with code official in all other references 
in this code. 

B. Section 106.5.2, Fee schedule, is amended by adding a second paragraph, to read as follows: 

The fee for each permit shall be as set forth in the latest adopted fee schedule as adopted by the 
Town of Hayden. 

C. Section 203.3, Prohibited locations, a second paragraph is added to read as follows: 

Liquefied petroleum gas-burning appliances shall not be installed in a pit, basement or similar 
location where heavier-than-air gas might collect, unless the following conditions are met: 

1. There shall be installed a listed gas detector that is interlocked to a listed solenoid valve 
located so as to shut off the supply of gas to the building in the event of an alarm. 

2. There shall be installed an exhaust system for the purpose of removing unburned gases.  
The exhaust system shall be interlocked to the gas detector so as to operate automatically in the 
event of an alarm.  The exhaust system shall provide a minimum of four (4) air changes per 
hour, and the exhaust intake shall be located within 6 inches of the floor. 

D. Section 903.3, Unvented gas log heaters, delete. 

(Ord. 639 § 1, 2011; Ord. 597 § 1, 2008; Ord. 582 § 1 (part), 2007; Ord. 660 § 1, 2014) 

Chapter 15.70 

International Plumbing Code 

15.70.010 International Plumbing Code Adoption. 
15.70.020 International Plumbing Code Amendments and Deletions. 

15.70.010 International Plumbing Code Adoption. 

There is hereby adopted by the Town of Hayden, for the purpose of regulating and controlling 
design, construction, installation, quality of materials, erection, installation, alteration, repair, 
location, relocation, replacement, addition to, use or maintenance of any plumbing system within the 
Town, that certain code known as the International Plumbing Code, 2009 Edition, including 
Appendices B, D, E, F and G, published by the International Code Council, 4951 West Flossmoor 



15-16 

Road, Country Club Hills, IL  60478.  The code, and the whole thereof, is adopted by reference 
thereto the same as if set forth in length in this section.  This adoption is subject to the amendments 
set forth herein.  (Ord. 639 § 1, 2011; Ord. 597 § 1, 2008; Ord. 582 § 1 (part), 2007; Ord. 660 § 1, 
2014) 

15.70.020 International Plumbing Code Amendments and Deletions. 

The International Plumbing Code, 2009 Edition, is amended as follows:  The following sections 
and paragraphs or subparagraphs of the 2009 International Plumbing Code are hereby amended or 
deleted as follows: 

A. Section 103.1, General, is amended to read as follows: 

The Building Department is hereby created and the official in charge shall be known as the 
Building Official.  Building Official shall be synonymous with code official in all other references 
in this code. 

B. Section 106.6.2, Fee schedule, is amended by adding a second paragraph, to read as follows: 

The fee for each permit shall be as set forth in the latest adopted fee schedule as adopted by the 
Town of Hayden. 

C. Section 1003.4, Sand and oil separators required, is amended to read as follows: 

At any building providing access to motor vehicles, repair garages, car washing facilities, and 
where oily or flammable liquid wastes are produced or stored, separators shall be installed into 
which water that may contain heavy solids, oil-bearing, grease-bearing or flammable wastes shall 
be discharged before emptying in the building drainage system or other point of disposal.  Sand 
and oil interceptors shall be designed and located so as to be provided with ready access for 
cleaning.  Location within a building will require a vapor tight cover. 

Exception:  Private garages attached to a dwelling or townhome. 

D. Section 802.1.6, Domestic dishwashing machines, is amended to read as follows: 

No domestic dishwashing machine shall be directly connected to a drainage system or food 
waste disposer without the use of an approved air gap fitting on the discharge side of the 
dishwashing machine.  Listed air gaps shall be installed with the flood level (FL) marking at or 
above the flood level of the sink or drain board, whichever is higher, or separately trapped with the 
air gap located on the stand pipe. 

E. Section 904.1, Roof extension, is amended by inserting the number "12 inches (457.2 mm)" 
where indicated in the first sentence. 

F. Section 1003.4.2, Sand and oil separator design, is amended to read as follows: 

Sand and oil separators shall be designed in accordance with 1003.4.2.1. 

G. Section 1003.4.2.1, General design requirements, is amended to read as follows: 



15-17 

Sand and oil separators shall have a depth of not less than 2 feet (610 mm) below the invert of 
the discharge drain.  The outlet opening of the separator shall have not less than an 18-inch (457 
mm) water seal.  The inlet shall extend to within 6 inches (152 mm) of the bottom of the 
interceptor.  Sand and oil separators shall have a minimum capacity of 6 cubic feet (0.168 m3) for 
the first 100 square feet (9.3 m2) of area to be drained, plus 1 cubic foot (0.028 m3) for each 
additional 100 square feet (9.3 m2) of area to be drained into the separator. 

F. Section 1003.4.2.2, Garages and service stations, delete.  (Ord. 639 § 1, 2011; Ord. 597 § 1, 
2008; Ord. 582 § 1 (part), 2007; Ord. 660 § 1, 2014) 

Chapter 15.74 

International Fuel Gas Code 

15.74.010 International Fuel Gas Code Adoption. 
15.74.020 International Fuel Gas Code Amendments and Deletions. 

15.74.010 International Fuel Gas Code Adoption. 

There is hereby adopted by the Town of Hayden, for the purpose of regulating and controlling the 
installation of fuel-gas piping systems, fuel-gas utilization equipment and related accessories within 
the Town, that certain code known as the International Fuel Gas Code, 2009 Edition, published by the 
International Code Council, 4951 West Flossmoor Road, Country Club Hills, IL  60478.  The code, 
and the whole thereof, is adopted by reference thereto the same as if set forth in length in this section.  
This adoption is subject to the amendments set forth herein.  (Ord. 639 § 1, 2011; Ord. 597 § 1, 2008; 
Ord. 582 § 1 (part), 2007; Ord. 660 § 1, 2014) 

15.74.020 International Fuel Gas Code Amendments and Deletions. 

The International Fuel Gas Code, 2009 Edition, is amended as follows:  The following sections 
and paragraphs or subparagraphs of the 2009 International Fuel Gas Code are hereby amended or 
deleted as follows: 

A. Section 103.1, General, is amended to read as follows: 

The Building Department is hereby created and the official in charge shall be known as the 
Building Official.  Building Official shall be synonymous with code official in all other references 
in this code. 

B. Section 106.5.2, Fee schedule, is amended by adding a second paragraph, to read as follows: 

The fee for each permit shall be as set forth in the latest adopted fee schedule as adopted by the 
Town of Hayden. 

C. Section 303.3, Prohibited locations, Exception 3, delete. 

D. Section 303.3, Prohibited locations, Exception 4, delete. 



15-18 

E. Section 303.3, Prohibited locations, a second paragraph is added to read as follows: 

Liquefied petroleum gas-burning appliances shall not be installed in a pit, basement or similar 
location where heavier-than-air gas might collect, unless the following conditions are met: 

1. There shall be installed a listed gas detector that is interlocked to a listed solenoid valve 
located so as to shut off the supply of gas to the building in the event of an alarm. 

2. There shall be installed an exhaust system for the purpose of removing unburned gases.  
The exhaust system shall be interlocked to the gas detector so as to operate automatically in the 
event of an alarm.  The exhaust system shall provide a minimum of four (4) air changes per 
hour, and the exhaust intake shall be located within 6 inches of the floor. 

F. Section 404.10, Minimum burial depth, is amended by the addition of the following: 

All plastic fuel gas piping shall be installed a minimum of 18 inches (457 mm) below grade. 

G. Section 603, Log lighters, delete. 

H. Section 621.2, Prohibited use, is amended to read as follows: 

Unvented room heaters are not to be installed in dwelling units. 

(Ord. 639 § 1, 2011; Ord. 597 § 1, 2008; Ord. 582 § 1 (part), 2007; Ord. 660 § 1, 2014) 

Chapter 15.76 

International Energy Conservation Code 

15.76.010 International Energy Conservation Code Adoption. 
15.76.020 International Energy Conservation Code Amendments and Deletions. 

15.76.010 International Energy Conservation Code Adoption. 

There is hereby adopted by the Town of Hayden, for the purpose of providing minimum standards 
for the effective use of energy, that certain code known as the International Energy Conservation 
Code, 2009 Edition, published by the International Code Council, 4951 West Flossmoor Road, 
Country Club Hills, IL  60478.  The code, and the whole thereof, is adopted by reference thereto the 
same as if set forth in length in this section.  This adoption is subject to the amendments set forth 
herein.  (Ord. 639 § 1, 2011; Ord. 597 § 1, 2008; Ord. 660 § 1, 2014) 

15.76.020 International Energy Conservation Code Amendments and Deletions. 

The following sections and paragraphs or subparagraphs of the 2009 International Energy 
Conservation Code are amended or deleted as follows: 

A. The International Energy Conservation Code is amended by replacing all references to 
"International Fire Code" with "adopted fire code." 



15-19 

B. The International Energy Conservation Code is amended by replacing all references to "ICC 
Electrical Code" with "National Electrical Code" as adopted by the State of Colorado. 

C. The International Energy Conservation Code Section 101.1, Title, is amended by the addition 
of the term "Town of Hayden" where indicated.  (Ord. 639 § 1, 2011; Ord. 597 § 1, 2008; Ord. 660 
§ 1, 2014) 

Chapter 15.80 

Uniform Solar Energy Code 

15.80.010 Adoption of the Uniform Solar Energy Code, 1994 Edition. 
15.80.020 Penalty. 

15.80.010 Adoption of the Uniform Solar Energy Code, 1994 Edition. 

Pursuant to the powers given to it by Colorado Revised Statutes 31-16-201 to 31-16-208, 1973, as 
amended, the Town of Hayden hereby adopts the following code by reference: Uniform Solar Energy 
Code, 1994 Edition.  (Ord. 455, 1997: Ord. 427, 1995) 

15.80.020 Penalty. 

Any person convicted of violating any provision of the preceding section shall, upon conviction, 
be punished by a fine of not more than three hundred dollars ($300) or be imprisoned for more than 
ninety (90) days, or by both such fine and imprisonment.  Each day that such violation continues shall 
constitute a separate offense.  (Ord. 455, 1997: Ord. 427, 1995) 

Chapter 15.90 

Uniform Swimming Pool, Spa and Hot Tub Code 

15.90.010 Adoption of the Uniform Swimming Pool, Spa and Hot Tub Code, 1994 Edition. 
15.90.020 Penalty. 

15.90.010 Adoption of the Uniform Swimming Pool, Spa and Hot Tub Code, 1994 Edition. 

Pursuant to the powers given to it by Colorado Revised Statutes 31-16-201 to 13-16-208, 1973, as 
amended, the Town of Hayden hereby adopts the following code by reference: Uniform Swimming 
Pool, Spa and Hot Tub, 1994 Edition.  (Ord. 455, 1997: Ord. 427, 1995) 

15.90.020 Penalty. 

Any person convicted of violating any provision of the preceding section shall, upon conviction, 
be punished by a fine of not more than three hundred dollars ($300) or be imprisoned for more than 
ninety (90) days, or by both such fine and imprisonment.  Each day that such violation continues shall 
constitute a separate offense.  (Ord. 455, 1997: Ord. 427, 1995) 



15-20 

Chapter 15.94 

Fee Schedule 

15.94.010 Adoption of Fee Schedule. 

15.94.010 Adoption of Fee Schedule. 

Building permit fees, electrical permit fees, plumbing permit fees, mechanical permit fees, pool, 
spa and hot tub permit fees, grading plan review fees, grading permit fees, other fees, factory-built 
home, manufactured home, and mobile home permit fees, elevator permit fees, and fire suppression 
and detection permit fees are hereby repealed and a new Table 3-A—Fee Schedule is adopted as 
follows: 

Table 3-A—Fee Schedule 

A. Building Permit and Plan Review Fees. 

1. Building Permit Fees. 

 

Total Valuation Fee 

$1.00 to $500.00 $15.00 

$501.00 to $2,000.00 $15.00 for the first $500.00 plus $2.00 for each additional $100.00 or fraction thereof, 
up to and including $2,000.00 

$2001.00 to 
$25,000.00 

$45.00 for the first $2,000.00 plus $9.00 for each additional $1,000.00 or fraction 
thereof, to and including $25,000.00 

$25,001.00 to 
$50,000.00 

$252.00 for the first $25,000.00 plus $6.50 for each additional $1,000.00 or fraction 
thereof, up to and including $50,000.00 

$50,001.00 to 
$100,000.00 

$414.50 for the first $50,000.00 plus $4.50 for each additional $1,000.00 or fraction 
thereof, up to and including $100,000.00 

$100,001.00 to 
$500,000.00 

$639.50 for the first $100,000.00 plus $3.50 for each additional $1,000.00 or fraction 
thereof, to and including $500,000.00 

$500,001.00 to 
$1,000,000.00 

$2,039.50 for the first $500,000.00 plus $3.00 for each additional $1,000.00 or fraction 
thereof, to and including $1,000,000.00 

$1,000,001.00 and up $3,539.50 for the first $1,000,000.00 plus $2.00 for each additional $1,000.00 or 
fraction thereof 

 
2. Plan Review Fee.  When a plan or other data is required to be submitted, a plan review fee 

shall be paid at the time of submitting plans and specifications for review.  The plan review fee for 
buildings and structures shall be sixty-five percent of the building permit fee as set forth above. 

B. Electrical Permit Fees. 



15-21 

 

Permit Issuance  
(in addition to items below): 

 

For issuing each permit $25.00 

For issuing each supplemental permit $15.00 

 
Residential.  This shall include modular homes, mobile homes, duplexes, condominiums and 
townhomes.  Fees for all new construction and extensive remodeling and additions shall be as follows 
(based on floor area): 

 

Not more than 1,000 sq. ft. $45.00 

Over 1,000 sq. ft. but not more than 1,500 sq. ft. $67.00 

Over 1,500 sq. ft. but not more than 2,000 sq. ft. $85.00 

For each additional 100 sq. ft. in excess of 2,000 sq. ft. add $3.50 

 
All other fees, except for inspection in mobile home and RV parks, shall be computed based on the 
dollar value of the electrical installation, including labor and material.  The fees shall be computed as 
follows: 

 

More than $0 but not more than $2,000.00 $45.00    

More than $2,000.00 but not more than $50,000.00 $18.00*    

More than $50,000.00 but not more than $500,000.00 $17.00**   

More than $500,000.00 $16.00*** 

Mobile homes and travel (RV) parks per space $50.00     
 
* per thousand or fraction thereof 

** per thousand or fraction thereof plus $50.00 

*** per thousand or fraction thereof plus $550.00 

C. Plumbing Permit Fees. 

 

Permit Issuance:  

1.  For the issuance of each permit $25.00 

2.  For issuing each supplemental permit $15.00 

 



15-22 

 

Unit Fee Schedule 
(in addition to item 1 or 2 above): 

 

1.  Fixtures and Vents: 

For each plumbing fixture or trap or set of fixtures on one trap (including water piping, 
drainage piping, and backflow protection therefore) 

$8.00 

For repair or alteration of drainage or vent piping, each fixture $10.00 

2.  Water Piping: 

For installation, alteration, or repair of building water piping and/or water-treating 
equipment, each 

$10.00 

3.  Roof Drains: 

Roof drain systems—per roof drain or overflow drain (inside building) $17.00 

4.  Water Heaters: 

For each water heater and/or vent $10.00 

5.  Fuel Gas Piping: 

For each gas pipe system of one to five outlets $20.00 

For each additional gas piping system outlet, per outlet $1.00 

6.  Disposal Systems and Interceptors: 

For each industrial waste pretreatment interceptor or grease trap $10.00 

7.  Backflow Protection: 

For each building backflow protective device or building atmospheric-type vacuum breakers 
or irrigation system backflow device: 

 

2 inches and smaller $10.00 

over 2 inches $20.00 

8.  Graywater System: 

For each graywater system $8.00 

9.  Medical Gas Piping: 

For each medical gas piping system serving one to five inlet(s)/outlets(s) for a specific gas $20.00 

For each additional medical gas inlet/outlet $1.00 

 
D. Mechanical Permit Fees. 



15-23 

 

Permit Issuance:  

1.  For the issuance of each permit $25.00 

2.  For issuing each supplemental permit $15.00 

Unit Fee Schedule  
(in addition to items 1 and 2 above):  

1.  Furnaces and Heaters: 

For the installation or relocation of each forced-air or gravity-type furnace or burner, including ducts 
and vents attached to such appliance, up to and including 100,000 Btu/h 

$16.50 

For the installation or relocation of each forced-air or gravity-type furnace or burner, including ducts 
and vents attached to such appliance over 100,000 Btu/h 

$21.00 

For the installation or relocation of each floor furnace, including vent $16.50 

For the installation or relocation of each suspended heater, recessed wall heater or floor-mounted 
unit heater 

$16.50 

For the installation of a wood or gas fired fireplace, insert, or stove $16.50 

2.  Fuel Gas Piping and Tanks: 

Gas piping systems of one to five outlets $20.00 

For each additional gas outlet $1.00 

LPG Tank set and yard piping $10.00 

3.  Boilers and Compressors: 

For the installation of relocation of each boiler or compressor to and including three horsepower or 
each absorption system to and including 100,000 Btu/h 

$16.50 

For the installation or relocation of each boiler or compressor over three horsepower to and 
including 15 horsepower, or each absorption system over 100,000 Btu/h to and including 500,000 
Btu/h 

$30.50 

For the installation or relocation of each boiler or compressor over 15 horsepower to and including 
30 horsepower, or each absorption system over 500,000 Btu/h to and including 1,000,000 Btu/h 

$42.00 

For the installation or relocation of each boiler or compressor over 30 horsepower to and including 
50 horsepower, or each absorption system over 1,000,000 Btu/h to and including 1,750,000 Btu/h 

$62.00 

For the installation or relocation of each boiler or refrigeration compressor over 50 horsepower, or 
each absorption system over 1,750,000 Btu/h 

$104.00 

4.  Air Handling Units: 

For each air-handling unit to and including 10,000 CFM, including ducts attached thereto $12.00 

For each air-handling over 10,000 CFM $20.00 

5.  Ventilation and Exhaust: 

For each ventilation fan connected to single duct $8.00 

For each ventilation system which is not a portion of any heating or air-conditioning system 
authorized by a permit 

$12.00 

For the installation of each domestic-type hood which is served by mechanical exhaust, including 
ducts for such hood 

$12.00 

For the installation of each commercial or industrial hood which is served by mechanical exhaust, 
including the ducts for such hood 

$30.00 



15-24 

6.  Evaporative Coolers: 

For each evaporative cooler other than a portable type $12.00 

7.  Appliance Vents: 

For the installation, relocation or replacement of each appliance vent installed and not included in an 
appliance permit (includes dryer duct) 

$8.50 

8.  Repair or Additions: 

For the repair of, alteration of, or addition to each heating appliance, refrigeration unit, cooling unit, 
absorption unit, or each heating, cooling, absorption, or evaporative cooling system, including 
installation of controls regulated by the UMC or IMC 

$15.50 

9.  Miscellaneous: 

For each appliance or piece of equipment regulated by the UMC or IMC but not classed in other 
appliance categories, or for which no other fee is listed in this schedule of fees 

$12.00 

 
E. Pool, Spa and Hot Tub Permit Fees. 

 

Permit Issuance:  

Public Pools and Hot Tubs (each) $30.00 

Private Pools and Hot Tub (each) $20.00 

 
Building permit and plan review fees along with plumbing, mechanical and electrical sub-permits 
shall apply.  Permit fees shall be based on building and sub-permit fee schedules. 

F. Grading Plan Review Fees. 

 

50 cubic yards no fee 

50 to 100 cubic yards $26.50 

100 to 1,000 cubic yards $42.00 

1,000 to 10,000 cubic yards $55.00 

10,000 to 100,000 cubic yards $55.00 for the first 10,000 cubic yards, plus $27.50 for each additional 
10,000 cubic yards or fraction thereof 

100,000 to 200,000 cubic yards $302.50 for the first 100,000 cubic yards, plus $14.85 for each 
additional 10,000 cubic yards or fraction thereof 

200,000 cubic yards or more $451.00 for the first 200,000 yards, plus $8.15 for each additional 
10,000 cubic yards or fraction thereof 

 
G. Grading Permit Fees. 

 

0 to 100 cubic yards $50.00 

100 to 1,000 cubic yards $50.00 for the first 100 cubic yards, plus $20.00 for each additional 100 
cubic yards or fraction thereof 

1,000 to 10,000 cubic yards $230.00 for the first 1,000 cubic yards, plus $16.50 for each additional 
1,000 cubic yards or fraction thereof 



15-25 

10,000 to 100,000 cubic yards $378.50 for the first 10,000 cubic yards, plus $75.00 for each additional 
10,000 cubic yards or fraction thereof 

100,000 cubic yards or more $1,053.50 for the first 100,000 cubic yards plus $42.00 for each 
additional 10,000 cubic yards or fraction thereof 

 
H. Other Fees. 

 

1.  Inspections outside of normal business hours (minimum charge – 4 hours) $50.00 per hour 

2.  Reinspection fees (work not ready for inspection or called for corrections not made) $50.00 

3.  Inspections for which no fee is specifically indicated (minimum charge – 2 hours) $50.00 per hour 

4.  Additional plan review required by changes, additions or revisions to or revisions to the 
approved plans (minimum charge – ½ hour) 

$50.00 per hour 

 
I. Factory-Built Home, Manufactured Homes and Mobile Home Permit Fee Schedule. 

 

Building Permit Fees: 

For each 
factory-built 
home 

$100.00 per section plus building permit and plan review fees as determined based on the 
valuation (material and labor) for foundation systems, porches, decks and stairs or other 
permanent construction which are not components of the factory-built home as produced. 

 
 

Electrical Permit Fees: 

For hookup of each factory-built home $45.00 

Fees for additions, remodels and repairs to factory-built home electrical 
systems shall be as determined for electrical permit fees. 

 

 
 

Plumbing Permit Fees: 

For the issuance of each permit $15.00 

For hookup of each factory-built home plumbing system $9.00 

Fees for additions, remodels and repairs to factory-built home plumbing 
systems shall be as determined for plumbing permit fees. 

 

 
 

Mechanical Permit Fees: 

For the issuance of each permit $15.00 

For hookup of fuel gas system to each factory-built home $9.00 

Fees for additions, remodels and repairs to factory-built home mechanical 
systems shall be as determined for mechanical permit fees. 

 

 



15-26 

 

Elevator Permit Fees: 

North West Colorado Council of Government (NWCCOG) is the inspection agency 
for all elevator installations in Hayden.  Contact NWCCOG at (970) 468-0295 ext.  
108 for fee information on elevator permits. 

 
 

Fire Suppression and Detection Permit Fees: 

The West Routt Fire Protection District has access and fire prevention review 
authority for buildings constructed in their district.  Contact the district for 
application submittal information and permit fees. 

 
(Ord. 582 § 2, 2007) 

 


